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Our Ref: FOI/08/12/20-2 
 
Date: 8 January 2021 
 
 
I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request the following 
information regarding paediatric training in Wales over a time period between 2010 and 2020. 
 
1.  List of paediatric trainee reps (2010-2020) 
 
HEIW is withholding the detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This 
information is protected by the Data Protection Act 2018 and General Data Protection Regulations, as 
its disclosure would constitute unfair and unlawful processing set out in Principle 1 Article 5 (1) (a). This 
exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.  
 
2.  List of Paediatric trainee committee members by year (2015-2020) 
 
HEIW does not hold this information. The Paediatric Trainee Committee is not managed by HEIW. 
 
3.  List of all Paediatric Trainee award winners by year (2015-2020) 
 
HEIW is withholding the detail for the years 2015 and 2016 under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000. This information is protected by the Data Protection Act 2018 and General Data 
Protection Regulations, as its disclosure would constitute unfair and unlawful processing set out in 
Principle 1 Article 5 (1) (a). This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply 
the public interest test.  
 
From 2017 onwards, the management of the paediatric trainee awards moved from a School led event  
to the Paediatric Awards for Training Achievements (PAFTA) which is managed by the Royal College 
of Paediatric and Child Health (RCPCH). In order to comply with our obligation under Section 16 to 
advise and assist, please see detailed below the link to the RCPCH PAFTA webpage. 
Paediatric Awards For Training Achievements (PAFTAs) | RCPCH 
 
4.  List of all Paediatric Trainee award nominees by year (2015-2020) 
 
HEIW is unable to locate any centrally held information relating to Paediatric Trainee award nominees  
for 2015 and 2016. However, as previously advised in Q3, from 2017 onwards, the management of the  
paediatric trainee awards moved from a School led event to the Paediatric Awards for Training  
Achievements (PAFTA) which is managed by the Royal College of Paediatric and Child Health 
(RCPCH).  
 
In order to comply with our obligation under Section 16 to advise and assist, please see detailed below  
the link to the RCPCH PAFTA webpage. 
Paediatric Awards For Training Achievements (PAFTAs) | RCPCH 
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5.  Copies of nominations for each trainee (2015-2020) 
 
HEIW is unable to locate any centrally held information relating to nominations for the years 2015 and  
2016. However, as previously advised in Q4, from 2017 onwards, the management of the paediatric  
trainee awards moved from a School led event to the Paediatric Awards for Training Achievements  
(PAFTA) which is managed by the Royal College of Paediatric and Child Health (RCPCH). In order to  
comply with our obligation under Section 16 to advise and assist, please see detailed below the link to  
the RCPCH PAFTA webpage. 
Paediatric Awards For Training Achievements (PAFTAs) | RCPCH 
 
6.  List of all the members of the Paediatric Trainee award judging panel by year (2015-2020) 
 
HEIW is unable to locate any centrally held information relating to the Paediatric Trainee award judging  
panel for 2015 and 2016. However, as previously advised in Q3 and from 2017 onwards, the 
management of the paediatric trainee awards moved from a School led event to the Paediatric Awards 
for Training Achievements (PAFTA) which is managed by the Royal College of Paediatric and Child  
Health (RCPCH). In order to comply with our obligation under Section 16 to advise and assist, please  
see detailed below the link to the RCPCH PAFTA webpage. 
Paediatric Awards For Training Achievements (PAFTAs) | RCPCH 
 
7.  List of all paediatric trainees nominated for BEST award (2015-2020) 
 
HEIW is withholding the detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This 
information is protected by the Data Protection Act 2018 and General Data Protection Regulations, as 
its disclosure would constitute unfair and unlawful processing set out in Principle 1 Article 5 (1) (a). This 
exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.  
 
8.  List of all paediatric trainees nominated for the RCPCH award (2015 -2020) 
 
HEIW does not hold this information. The RCPCH Award is managed by the Royal College for 
Paediatrics and Child Health. In order to comply with our obligation under Section 16 to advise and 
assist, please see detailed below the link to the RCPCH Fellowships, awards and prizes webpage. 
Fellowships, awards and prizes | RCPCH 
 
9.  Copies of nominations for each trainee 
 
HEIW holds information regarding nominations for the BEST award however, we are withholding the 
detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This information is protected by the 
Data Protection Act 2018 and General Data Protection Regulations, as its disclosure would constitute 
unfair and unlawful processing set out in Principle 1 Article 5 (1) (a). This exemption is absolute and 
therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test. 
 
10.  List of Paediatric Specialty Trainee committee members by year (2010-2020) 

Split by: UK medical graduates, EEA medical graduates, international medical graduates 
Split by: ethnicity 

 
Please find enclosed a list of the Paediatric Specialty Trainee Committee Membership Roles for the 
years you have requested. HEIW does not hold information regarding graduation or ethnicity for 
Committee Members. However, HEIW is withholding the names of the individual representatives for the 
membership roles under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This information is 
protected by the Data Protection Act 2018 and General Data Protection Regulations, as its disclosure 
would constitute unfair and unlawful processing set out in Principle 1 Article 5 (1) (a). This exemption is 
absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test. 


